
From: Bruce Larsen   
Sent: Monday, July 09, 2012 3:46 PM 
To:  
Subject: WRIA 18 
 
Formal question for the record: 
 
At the Sequim hearing, one of the bureaucrats stated that funding for the 
reimbursement of loss of expectation rights had been investigated.  What has 
been done in this regard? Where are the details of this investigation?   
 


	From: Bruce Larsen [mailto:pwddc@me.com]



