



City of Bellingham
Public Works Department

Deliverable 4.3 - Equipment Bid Results and Documentation of Bid Process

Engineering

104 W. Magnolia Street, Suite 109
Bellingham, WA 98225
(360) 778-7900
Fax: (360) 778-7901
TTY: (360) 778-8382
pw@cob.org

Natural Resources

Physical: 2200 Nevada Street
Mailing: 2221 Pacific Street
Bellingham, WA 98229
(360) 778-7800
Fax: (360) 778-7801
pw@cob.org

Operations

2221 Pacific Street
Bellingham, WA 98229
(360) 778-7700
Fax: (360) 778-7701
pw@cob.org

AFFIDAVIT OF PUBLICATION

Account #	Ad Number	Identification	PO	Amount	Cols	Lines
450876	0002553949	(L3949)CITY OF BELLINGHAM, WA 43B-2		\$148.75	1	33

Attention: Rose Kelleher

CITY OF BELLINGHAM PUBLIC WORKS
2221 PACIFIC ST
BELLINGHAM, WA 982295823

(L3949)CITY OF BELLINGHAM, WA
43B-2016

Bioretention Hydrological
Performance Phase II Equipment
Notice is hereby given that the City
of Bellingham is requesting bids
from vendors for Bioretention
Hydrological Performance Phase II
Equipment.

Interested vendors may view the so-
licitation documents on the City of
Bellingham website at <https://www.ebidexchange.com/bellingham> or in
person at the Purchasing Office,
2221 Pacific Street, Bellingham,
Washington, Monday thru Friday,
8:00AM - 4:00PM.

Individuals with questions about the
bidding process may contact the
Purchasing Office at the above ad-
dress or by calling 360-778-7750.

The Purchasing Office, must receive
sealed bids no later than **11:00 AM
on July 25, 2016.**

The City reserves the right to post-
pone making the award for a rea-
sonable length of time, to reject any
and all bids, or parts of bids as may
be in the best interest of the City.
Contact Rose Kelleher, Buyer City of
Bellingham for additional information
at 360-778-7750.

Published: July 11, 2016

ALEXIS SKOG, being duly sworn,
deposes and says: That he/she is the
Principal Clerk of The Bellingham
Herald, a daily newspaper printed and
published in Bellingham, Whatcom
County, State of Washington, and
having a
general circulation therein, and which
said newspaper has been
continuously and uninterruptedly
published in said County during a
period of six months prior to the first
publication of the notice, a copy of
which is attached hereto: that said
notice was published in The
Bellingham Herald, as amended, for:

1 Insertions

Published On:

July 11, 2016


(Principal Clerk)

Subscribed and sworn on this 15th
day of July in the year of 2016 before
me, a Notary Public, personally
appeared before me Alexis Skog
known or identified to me to be the
person whose name subscribed to the
within instrument, and being by first
duly sworn, declared that the
statements therein are true, and
acknowledged to me that he/she
executed the same.




Notary Public in and for the state of
Washington, residing in Whatcom
County 1155 N State St, Bellingham,
WA 98225



**CITY OF BELLINGHAM
 BID REPORT**

Rose Kelleher
 David Baird

FINAL

Eli Mackiewicz - Project Manager

BID NAME

BID NUMBER DATE OPENED

Bioretention Hydrologic Performance Equipment	43B-2016	7/25/2016	
---	----------	-----------	--

Company Name

CITY/STATE

TOTAL BID AMOUNT

Hydrological Services America, LLC (Hydrological Services item)	Lake Worth, FL	Total includes shipping and sales tax	\$7,872.00
EnviroSupply & Service, Inc. (Solinst items)	Irvine, CA	Total includes shipping and sales tax	\$40,686.41
Whitney Equipment Company, Inc. (Thel-Mar items)	Bothell, WA	Total includes shipping and sales tax	\$9,455.43
Enviro Tech Services Company (Solinst items)	Martinez, CA	Total includes shipping and sales tax	\$37,714.55
USABlueBook (all items)	Gurnee, IL	Total includes shipping and sales tax	\$51,317.89

City of Bellingham

43B-2016

Bioretention Hydrologic Performance Phase II Equipment

	USA Bluebook	EnviroTech	Whitney Equ.	Enviro Supply	Hydrological Svcs.
Solinst Levellogger Edge 3001 LT, M5/F15	\$464.80 EA	\$456.00 EA	No Bid	\$495.00 EA	No Bid
Solinst Barologger Edge 3001 LT, M1.5/F5	\$243.20 EA	\$239.00 EA	No Bid	\$253.00 EA	No Bid
Solinst Rainlogger Edge 3002 with connection cable	\$237.60 EA	\$233.00 EA	No Bid	\$258.00 EA	No Bid
Solinst Download Cable 3001 Optical Reader USB for Levellogger	\$119.20 EA	\$118.00 EA	No Bid	\$124.00 EA	No Bid
Thel-Mar 6 inch weir with thumbwheel and bubble pipe	\$287.00 EA	No Bid	\$307.10 EA	No Bid	No Bid
Thel-Mar 8 inch weir with thumbwheel and bubble pipe	\$373.33 EA	No Bid	\$358.55 EA	No Bid	No Bid
Thel-Mar 12 inch weir with thumbwheel and bubble pipe	\$390.00 EA	No Bid	\$415.25 EA	No Bid	No Bid
Hydrological Services TB-6 Rain Gauge and TB334 mounting pipe	\$422.00 EA (not responsive)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$984.00 EA

USA Bluebook	\$9,227.51
EnviroTech	\$37,714.55
Hydrological Services	\$7,872.00
Total includes shipping and sales tax	\$54,814.06



**CITY OF BELLINGHAM
BID REPORT**

Rose Kelleher
David Baird
Eli Mackiewicz - Project Manager

BID NAME	BID NUMBER	DATE OPENED	TOTAL BID AMOUNT	
Bioretention Hydrologic Performance Equipment	43B-2016	7/25/2016	The following are the results from the public bid opening. The results have not been verified for mathematical accuracy, responsiveness or responsibility of the bidder. They are only the results as announced at the bid opening.	
Company Name	CITY/STATE		TOTAL BID AMOUNT	
Hydrological Services America, LLC (Hydrological Services item)	Lake Worth, FL		Total includes shipping and sales tax	\$7,872.00
EnviroSupply & Service, Inc. (Solinst items)	Irvine, CA		Total includes shipping and sales tax	\$40,686.41
Whitney Equipment Company, Inc. (Thel-Mar items)	Bothell, WA		Total includes shipping and sales tax	\$756.78
Enviro Tech Services Company (Solinst items)	Martinez, CA		Total includes shipping and sales tax	\$37,731.94
USABlueBook (all items)	Gurnee, IL		Total includes shipping and sales tax	\$51,317.89

City of Bellingham

43B-2016

Bioretention Hydrologic Performance Phase II Equipment

ITEM	PART NUMBER	QUANTITY	PRICE PER EACH	EXTENDED AMOUNT
Solinst Levellogger Edge 3001 LT, M5/F15	Solinst 110023	50	\$ 464.80	\$ 23240.00
Solinst Barologger Edge 3001 LT, M1.5/F5	Solinst 110179	40	\$ 243.20	\$ 9728.00
Solinst Rainlogger Edge 3002 with connection cable	Solinst 111108	8	\$ 237.60	\$ 1900.80
Solinst Download Cable 3001 Optical Reader (USB) for Levellogger	Solinst 110149	4	\$ 119.20	\$ 476.80
Thel-Mar 6 inch weir with thumbwheel and bubble pipe	THEL-MAR EXACT 6"	7	\$ 287.00	\$ 2009.00
Thel-Mar 8 inch weir with thumbwheel and bubble pipe	THEL-MAR EXACT 8"	9	\$ 373.33	\$ 3359.97
Thel-Mar 12 inch weir with thumbwheel and bubble pipe	THEL-MAR EXACT 12"	8	\$ 390.00	\$ 3120.00
Hydrological Services TB-6 Rain Gauge and TB334 mounting plate	GLOBAL WATER R6000 USABLE BOOK # 72125	8	\$ 422.00	\$ 3376.00

8488.97
TAX 1738.54
9,227.51

City of Bellingham
43B-2016
Bioretention Hydrologic Performance Phase II Equipment

State number of days delivery to city of Bellingham delivery dock from date of City Council approval	<u>4.5 WEEKS</u>
Total amount includes 8.7% sales tax and freight FOB destination	\$ OK 51317.89 47,210.57

subtotal

TAX 4,107.32

City of Bellingham
43B-2016
Bioretention Hydrologic Performance Phase II Equipment

The undersigned declares that before preparing this bid, they have carefully read the specifications, requirements, and terms & conditions and that this bid is made with full knowledge of the kind and quality of items to be furnished, and this bid is as stated on documents submitted in response to the Bid.

By signing this bid I duly swear that this bid herewith submitted is a genuine and not a sham or collusive bid, or made in the interest or on behalf of any person not therein named; and I further say that I have not directly or indirectly induced or solicited any bidder to put in a sham bid, or any other person or corporation to refrain from bidding; and that I have not in any manner sought collusion to secure to myself an advantage over any other bidder or bidders.

I acknowledge receipt of all addenda (if any) and I acknowledge that I have verified this information by checking on the City's website for any addenda that have been issued.

HD Supply Facilities Maintenance
d/b/a USABlueBook

COMPANY: _____

ADDRESS: PO Box 9004 Gurnee IL 60031

PHONE: 800-548-1234 FAX: 847-377-5160 EMAIL: QUOTES@USABlueBook.com

CITY, STATE, ZIP CODE: Gurnee IL 60031

SIGNATURE OF PERSON AUTHORIZED TO SIGN: 

PRINT NAME OF SIGNER GREGORY JOYCE TITLE BID COORDINATOR

CITY OF BELLINGHAM BUSINESS REGISTRATION NUMBER _____

RESPONSE TO BID 43B-2016

To: City of Bellingham, Washington

From: EnviroTech Services Company / Fred Ousey / Owner

Re: Bid Number 43B-2016

Date: July 21, 2016

Attached is EnviroTech Services Company's Response to the City of Bellingham's Bid Number 43B-2016.

EnviroTech is a recognized stocking distributor of Solinst Levelloggers, since 1987. We are located in Martinez, California and are a certified small business Company as shown by the seal attached.

Furthermore, we have registered with the City of Bellingham to participate in this BID.

If you have any further questions, please contact me directly at 1-800-468-8921 or at Fred@envirotechonline.com



**City of Bellingham
43B-2016**

Bioretention Hydrologic Performance Phase II Equipment

ITEM	PART NUMBER	QUANTITY	PRICE PER EACH	EXTENDED AMOUNT
Solinst Levellogger Edge 3001 LT, M5/F15		50	\$ 456	\$ 22,800
Solinst Barologger Edge 3001 LT, M1.5/F5		40	\$ 239	\$ 9,576
Solinst Rainlogger Edge 3002 with connection cable		8	\$ 233	\$ 1,864
Solinst Download Cable 3001 Optical Reader (USB) for Levellogger		4	\$ 118	\$ 472
Thel-Mar 6 inch weir with thumbwheel and bubble pipe		7	No Bid \$	No Bid \$
Thel-Mar 8 inch weir with thumbwheel and bubble pipe		9	No Bid \$	No Bid \$
Thel-Mar 12 inch weir with thumbwheel and bubble pipe		8	No Bid \$	No Bid \$
Hydrological Services TB-6 Rain Gauge and TB334 mounting plate		8	No Bid \$	No Bid \$

MK
 9,560⁰⁰
 34,696⁰⁰
 3,018.52
 37,714.55
 total

Page Total - 34,712
 34,696⁰⁰

City of Bellingham
43B-2016
Bioretention Hydrologic Performance Phase II Equipment

State number of days delivery to city of Bellingham delivery dock from date of City Council approval	<u>10-14 days</u>
Total amount includes 8.7% sales tax and freight FOB destination	\$ 37,731. ⁹⁴

34,696.⁰⁰
3,018.52^{TAX}
37,714.55 PK - OK

City of Bellingham
43B-2016
Bioretention Hydrologic Performance Phase II Equipment

The undersigned declares that before preparing this bid, they have carefully read the specifications, requirements, and terms & conditions and that this bid is made with full knowledge of the kind and quality of items to be furnished, and this bid is as stated on documents submitted in response to the Bid.

By signing this bid I duly swear that this bid herewith submitted is a genuine and not a sham or collusive bid, or made in the interest or on behalf of any person not therein named; and I further say that I have not directly or indirectly induced or solicited any bidder to put in a sham bid, or any other person or corporation to refrain from bidding; and that I have not in any manner sought collusion to secure to myself an advantage over any other bidder or bidders.

I acknowledge receipt of all addenda (if any) and I acknowledge that I have verified this information by checking on the City's website for any addenda that have been issued.

COMPANY: Enviro Tech Services Company

ADDRESS: 4851 Sunrise Drive, Suite 101,

PHONE: (925) 370-1541 FAX: (925) 370-8037 EMAIL: Fred@envirotechoonline.com

CITY, STATE, ZIP CODE: Martinez, California 94553

SIGNATURE OF PERSON AUTHORIZED TO SIGN: 

PRINT NAME OF SIGNER Fred Ousey TITLE CEO

CITY OF BELLINGHAM BUSINESS REGISTRATION NUMBER Pending

City of Bellingham

43B-2016

Bioretention Hydrologic Performance Phase II Equipment

The undersigned declares that before preparing this bid, they have carefully read the specifications, requirements, and terms & conditions and that this bid is made with full knowledge of the kind and quality of items to be furnished, and this bid is as stated on documents submitted in response to the Bid.

By signing this bid I duly swear that this bid herewith submitted is a genuine and not a sham or collusive bid, or made in the interest or on behalf of any person not therein named; and I further say that I have not directly or indirectly induced or solicited any bidder to put in a sham bid, or any other person or corporation to refrain from bidding; and that I have not in any manner sought collusion to secure to myself an advantage over any other bidder or bidders.

I acknowledge receipt of all addenda (if any) and I acknowledge that I have verified this information by checking on the City's website for any addenda that have been issued.

COMPANY: Hydrological Services America LLC

ADDRESS: 3550 23rd. Ave. S. Suite 5

PHONE: (561) 459-4876 FAX: (561) 582-0049 EMAIL: Sales@hydrologicalusa.com

CITY, STATE, ZIP CODE: Lake Worth, FL 33461

SIGNATURE OF PERSON AUTHORIZED TO SIGN: 

PRINT NAME OF SIGNER MATT STEAGER TITLE MANAGER

CITY OF BELLINGHAM BUSINESS REGISTRATION NUMBER Submitted for processing
July 8, 2016

City of Bellingham

43B-2016

Bioretention Hydrologic Performance Phase II Equipment

ITEM	PART NUMBER	QUANTITY	PRICE PER EACH	EXTENDED AMOUNT
Solinst Levellogger Edge 3001 LT, M5/F15	X	50	\$ -	\$ NO Bid
Solinst Barologger Edge 3001 LT, M1.5/F5	X	40	\$ -	\$ NO Bid
Solinst Rainlogger Edge 3002 with connection cable	X	8	\$ -	\$ NO Bid
Solinst Download Cable 3001 Optical Reader (USB) for Levellogger	X	4	\$ -	\$ NO Bid
Thel-Mar 6 inch weir with thumbwheel and bubble pipe	X	7	\$ -	\$ NO Bid
Thel-Mar 8 inch weir with thumbwheel and bubble pipe	X	9	\$ -	\$ NO Bid
Thel-Mar 12 inch weir with thumbwheel and bubble pipe	X	8	\$ -	\$ NO Bid
Hydrological Services TB-6 Rain Gauge and TB334 mounting plate	TB6/0.01 + TB334	8	\$ 984. ⁰⁰	\$ 7,872

City of Bellingham
43B-2016
Bioretention Hydrologic Performance Phase II Equipment

State number of days delivery to city of Bellingham delivery dock from date of City Council approval	<u>60</u>
Total amount includes 8.7% sales tax and freight FOB destination	\$ 7,872

City of Bellingham

43B-2016

Bioretention Hydrologic Performance Phase II Equipment

ITEM	PART NUMBER	QUANTITY	PRICE PER EACH	EXTENDED AMOUNT
Solinst Levellogger Edge 3001 LT, M5/F15		50	\$	\$
Solinst Barologger Edge 3001 LT, M1.5/F5		40	\$	\$
Solinst Rainlogger Edge 3002 with connection cable		8	\$	\$
Solinst Download Cable 3001 Optical Reader (USB) for Levellogger		4	\$	\$
Thel-Mar 6 inch weir with thumbwheel and bubble pipe		7	\$ 307.10	\$ 2149.70
Thel-Mar 8 inch weir with thumbwheel and bubble pipe		9	\$ 358.55	\$ 3226.95
Thel-Mar 12 inch weir with thumbwheel and bubble pipe		8	\$ 415.25	\$ 3322.00
Hydrological Services TB-6 Rain Gauge and TB334 mounting plate		8	\$	\$

City of Bellingham
43B-2016
Bioretention Hydrologic Performance Phase II Equipment

State number of days delivery to city of Bellingham delivery dock from date of City Council approval	<u>14-21 days</u>
Total amount includes 8.7% sales tax and freight FOB destination	\$ 756.78 ^{TAX}

8,698.65 sub total
9,455.43 total
OK

City of Bellingham

43B-2016

Bioretention Hydrologic Performance Phase II Equipment

The undersigned declares that before preparing this bid, they have carefully read the specifications, requirements, and terms & conditions and that this bid is made with full knowledge of the kind and quality of items to be furnished, and this bid is as stated on documents submitted in response to the Bid.

By signing this bid I duly swear that this bid herewith submitted is a genuine and not a sham or collusive bid, or made in the interest or on behalf of any person not therein named; and I further say that I have not directly or indirectly induced or solicited any bidder to put in a sham bid, or any other person or corporation to refrain from bidding; and that I have not in any manner sought collusion to secure to myself an advantage over any other bidder or bidders.

I acknowledge receipt of all addenda (if any) and I acknowledge that I have verified this information by checking on the City's website for any addenda that have been issued.

COMPANY: Whitney Equipment Company Inc

ADDRESS: 21222 30th Av SE Suite 110

PHONE: 425-486-9499 FAX: 425-485-7409 EMAIL: mweinstein@weci.com

CITY, STATE, ZIP CODE: Bonnell, WA 98021

SIGNATURE OF PERSON AUTHORIZED TO SIGN: William Carson

PRINT NAME OF SIGNER: William Carson TITLE: Vice President

CITY OF BELLINGHAM BUSINESS REGISTRATION NUMBER 600 105 028

City of Bellingham

43B-2016

Bioretention Hydrologic Performance Phase II Equipment

ITEM	PART NUMBER	QUANTITY	PRICE PER EACH	EXTENDED AMOUNT
Solinst Levellogger Edge 3001 LT, M5/F15	110023	50	\$ 495.00	\$ 24,750.00
Solinst Barologger Edge 3001 LT, M1.5/F5	110179	40	\$ 253.00	\$ 10,120.00
Solinst Rainlogger Edge 3002 with connection cable	111108	8	\$ 258.00	\$ 2,064.00
Solinst Download Cable 3001 Optical Reader (USB) for Levellogger	110149	4	\$ 124.00	\$ 496.00
Thel-Mar 6 inch weir with thumbwheel and bubble pipe	— NO BID	7	\$	\$
Thel-Mar 8 inch weir with thumbwheel and bubble pipe	— NO BID	9	\$	\$
Thel-Mar 12 inch weir with thumbwheel and bubble pipe	— NO BID	8	\$	\$
Hydrological Services TB-6 Rain Gauge and TB334 mounting plate	— NO BID	8	\$	\$

City of Bellingham
43B-2016
Bioretention Hydrologic Performance Phase II Equipment

The undersigned declares that before preparing this bid, they have carefully read the specifications, requirements, and terms & conditions and that this bid is made with full knowledge of the kind and quality of items to be furnished, and this bid is as stated on documents submitted in response to the Bid.

By signing this bid I duly swear that this bid herewith submitted is a genuine and not a sham or collusive bid, or made in the interest or on behalf of any person not therein named; and I further say that I have not directly or indirectly induced or solicited any bidder to put in a sham bid, or any other person or corporation to refrain from bidding; and that I have not in any manner sought collusion to secure to myself an advantage over any other bidder or bidders.

I acknowledge receipt of all addenda (if any) and I acknowledge that I have verified this information by checking on the City's website for any addenda that have been issued.

COMPANY: ENVIRO SUPPLY & SERVICE, INC.

ADDRESS: 1791 KAISER AVE

PHONE: (949) 757-0353 FAX: (949) 757-0363 EMAIL: order@envirosupply.net

CITY, STATE, ZIP CODE: IRVINE, CA. 92614

SIGNATURE OF PERSON AUTHORIZED TO SIGN: 

PRINT NAME OF SIGNER CARLOS F. CARRILLO TITLE SALES MANAGER

CITY OF BELLINGHAM BUSINESS REGISTRATION NUMBER PENDING